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Subject:
From:
Date:
To:

Re:

Jeri Stenhouse <jstenhouse1@me.com>

Tue, Dec 17,2013 4:57 pm

Double Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>

Workspace Webmail :: Print

Bill

Service.

<|eft.letterhead>

Can | send a check for the boys that did our even Saturday Night they were wonderful. If so do | write it out to Dble Platinum DJ

Should | just get to gift cards Please let me know what would be best.
Sorry none of us thought ahead to bring cash for them.

On Dec 12,2013, at 1:44 PM, Double Platinum DJ Service wrote:

Hey Jeri,

Yes, the check made it over. Thank you. They will be there around 6pm for set up. [Bill-DP]

-------- Original Message -~====-~

Subject: Re:

From: Jeri Stenhouse <jstenhousel@me.com>

Date: Wed, December 11, 2013 8:25 pm

To: Double Platinum DJ Service <info@doubleplatinumdj.com>

bill,

I wanted to make sure you received the check for Saturday Night.
Please let me know what time your or your staff will be arriving. The
event is 7pm to 11pm. Also, please let me know if there is anything
else you need from Heather or L

Thanks for all of your help.
Jeri Stenhouse
Just in case you should need to get in touch with me 404-386-1440.

On Dec 4, 2013, at 8:49 AM, Double Platinum D] Service wrote:

<left.letterhead> Hey Jeri,

I attached a contract. [Bill-DP]

———————— Original Message --------
Subject: Fwd:

From: Jeri Stenhouse
<jstenhousel@me.com>

Date: Tue, December 03, 2013 6:21 pm
To: Double Platinum DJ Service
<info@doubleplatinumdj.com>

Bill

Please help!

for some reason I can not find the
contract attachment.

although all my emails say there is an

attachment I can not open.
can you please send so I can give Liz a

cpy.
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